
Trading Conditions 

1.1.3 Procedure for Options and Futures Trading 
Each Exchange day is composed of the following periods: 
 
(1) Pre-Trading Period 
 
Prior to the commencement of options and futures trading, orders and quotes may, until the time set by 
the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges, be entered into the electronic data processing 
("EDP") system of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(2) Opening Period 
 
Options and futures trading begins with the determination of an opening price for each option series and 
each futures contract. The Opening Period comprises the Pre-Opening Period and the netting process. For 
the purpose of determining a particular opening price, additional orders and quotes may be entered until 
a time established by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges; a preliminary opening price 
will be continuously displayed during this period (the "Pre-Opening Period"). Quotes may be individually 
cancelled or amended during the Pre-Opening Period, but all quotes for an individual product may not 
collectively be changed, cancelled or withdrawn from trading during this period. During the subsequent 
netting process, the greatest possible number of orders and quotes contained in the system shall be 
matched for the purpose of determining a final opening price of each option series and futures contract. 
The Eurex Exchanges do not guarantee the execution of any order or quote at such opening price. 
 
The Opening Period with respect to a product shall end as soon as the netting process has been 
completed for all option series and/or all futures contracts based on such product. 
 
If no market orders exist for any option series or futures contract and matching between limit orders or 
limit orders and quotes is not possible, the Opening Period shall end without the determination of an 
opening price. 
 
(3) Trading Period 
 
After the close of the Opening Period for a product, the relevant contracts will be traded on a continuous 
basis. 
 
(4) Post-Trading Period 
 
After the close of the Trading Period, the EDP system of the Eurex Exchanges will remain available to 
Exchange Participants for data entry. 
 
The Post-Trading Full Period shall start directly after terminating the Trading Period. During the Post-
Trading Full Period data requests as well as data input are possible and admissible. 
 
Directly after terminating the Post-Trading Full Period, the Post-Trading Restricted Period shall start 
during which only data requests are possible and admissible. 

1.2.5 Binding Nature of Transactions 
(1) All transactions effected through the user devices Participant Front End System of an Exchange 
Participant are binding on such Exchange Participant. 
 
(2) The Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges are authorized, however, to cancel a transaction 
if its price materially and clearly deviates from the market price prevailing at the time the transaction is 
effected and if an Exchange Participant directly affected by the transaction promptly protests to the 
Eurex Exchanges that it mistakenly entered the order or the quote incorrectly into the trading system of 
the Eurex Exchanges. The expenses of the Eurex Exchanges incurred in connection with such cancellation 
and reversal shall be borne by the Exchange Participant causing the cancellation. The transmission of 
such an application in writing to one of the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submission to all Eurex 



Exchanges. 
 
(3) The Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges may cancel transactions ex officio if such action 
is necessary to ensure orderly trading at the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(4) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for controlling access to its data entry devices and other 
EDP equipment linked to the EDP system of the Eurex Exchanges. 

1.3.2 Market Orders 
(1) Market orders may be entered as buy orders or sell orders. Their validity may be made subject to 
one of the following conditions: 
 
a) "Good-till-cancelled" (valid until withdrawn) 
 
b) "Good-till-date" (valid until the expiration of a period) 
 
Market orders relating to products to which the Pro Rata Matching Principle (subsection 1.2.2 paragraph 
(5)) applies may only be entered into the EDP system of the Eurex Exchanges during the Trading Period 
and must carry the IOC (immediate-or-cancel) Restriction Code. To the extent that such market orders 
cannot be executed in their entirety immediately, the unexecuted portions of such an order will not be 
entered in the order book but shall be deleted. 
 
Market orders relating to products to which the principle of priority allocation on the basis of price and 
time (subsection 1.2.2 paragraph (4)) applies and which have no validity condition are valid only until 
the end of the Trading Period of an Exchange day. To the extent that they have not been executed, 
market orders without validity conditions shall be deleted from the EDP system of the Eurex Exchanges 
after the Trading Period of the relevant Exchange day. 
 
(2) Market orders concerning options contracts that are entered during the Trading Period may be 
executed with quotes contained in the order book and with those orders that are no less favorable than 
the least favorable quote with respect to the relevant option series. The market orders entered shall be 
executed with market orders, limit orders and quotes contained in the order book in the order from the 
most favorable price to the price of the least favorable quote. Any market orders not executed in whole 
or in part shall thereafter be transferred into the order book. New incoming quotes shall be executed with 
any remaining market orders or shall serve as the price scale for the execution of market orders with 
other orders contained in the order book. All market orders shall be executed before any limit orders are 
executed. If and for so long as no quotes are entered, market quotes may, notwithstanding the first 
sentence of this paragraph, also be executed with one another or with a limit order if an incoming limit 
order could have been executed with a limit order already in the order book. In such a case, the price at 
which the limit orders could have been executed with one another shall serve as the execution price for 
the remaining market orders. Such orders shall be executed with other market or limit orders in 
accordance with the general price rules set forth in subsection 1.2.2 paragraph (4). In the event that a 
market order is still in the order book on the Exchange day following its entry, it will be processed as a 
market order during the Opening Period of such Exchange day. 
 
(3) Market orders concerning futures contracts that are entered during the Trading Period will only be 
executed with limit orders or quotes contained in the order book the prices of which are within a certain 
range, as determined by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges, above or below, as 
appropriate, the last price at which a contract was entered into (the "last contract price"). The last 
contract price shall be the price at which two limit orders, two quotes or one limit order and one quote 
were matched for a specific contract. If incoming market orders cannot be executed in full or in part, 
they will be transferred into the order book. New incoming limit orders or quotes will be executed with 
any remaining market orders if their prices are within the range above or below, as appropriate, the last 
contract price. If, although the prices of incoming limit orders or quotes are not within such range, they 
could nevertheless be executed with other limit orders or quotes contained in the order book, the price at 
which such limit orders or quotes could be executed with each other will then be the new "last contract 
price" within the meaning of the second sentence of this paragraph. Such limit orders or quotes will be 
executed with other market or limit orders in accordance with the general priority rules set forth in 
subsection 1.2.2 paragraph (4) or subsection 1.2.2 paragraph (5). If no last contract price within the 



meaning of the second sentence of this paragraph can be determined on a given Exchange day, market 
orders will not be executed on that Exchange day. If a new futures contract is introduced, market orders 
entered for such contract shall only be matched after two limit orders, two quotes or one limit order and 
one quote able to be executed with one another have determined the contract price. 
 
If a market order is still in the order book on the Exchange day following the day on which it was 
entered, it will be processed as a market order during the Opening Period of such Exchange day. 
 
(4) Market orders entered during the Pre-Trading Period or the Post-Trading Full Period will be processed 
as market orders during the next Opening Period; the rules set forth in paragraph (1) shall not be 
affected hereby. 

1.3.3 Limit Orders 
(1) The following types of orders stating a specific price ("limit orders") exist: 
 
a) Unrestricted limit orders (paragraph (2)) 
 
b) Restricted limit orders (paragraph (3)) 
 
c) Limit orders valid for one day (paragraph (4)) 
 
(2) The validity of unrestricted limit orders must be subject to one of the following conditions: 
 
a) "Good-till-cancelled" (valid until withdrawn) 
 
b) "Good-till-date" (valid for a certain period) 
 
Unrestricted limit orders may be entered during the Pre-Trading Period, the Pre-Opening Period, the 
Trading Period or the Post-Trading Full Period. Unrestricted limit orders that are not executed 
immediately shall be entered in the order book. If an incoming limit order or quote may be executed with 
an unrestricted limit order already in the order book, a transaction shall be effected at the price of the 
order contained in the order book. 
 
(3) Restricted limit orders for options contracts must be subject to one of the following limitations on 
execution: 
 
a) "Fill-or-kill" (immediate execution in full or cancellation of the order) 
 
b) "Immediate-or-cancel" (immediate execution of the order to the extent possible and cancellation of 
the unexecuted part). 
 
Restricted limit orders for futures contracts must be subject to the "immediate-or-cancel" limitation on 
execution. 
 
Restricted limit orders may only be entered during the Trading Period. They shall not be entered in the 
order book. 
 
(4) Limit orders entered without validity conditions or limitations on their execution shall be valid only 
until the end of the Trading Period of an Exchange day. To the extent that they have not been executed, 
limit orders shall be deleted from the EDP system of the Eurex Exchanges after the Trading Period of the 
relevant Exchange day. 
 
(5) A limit purchase order and a limit sale order and/or quotes relating to the same contract may, in case 
they could immediately be executed against each other, in principle, only be entered consecutively by an 
Exchange Participant (a cross-trade) or - pursuant to a prior understanding - by two different Exchange 
Participants (a pre-arranged trade) with the condition that the elapsed time between the two entries be 
 
- at least 15 seconds in the case of options contracts, and 
 



- at least 5 seconds in the case of futures contracts. 
 
The above-defined elapsed times need not be adhered to if, prior to entering the cross-trade or pre-
arranged trade, the initiating Exchange Participant enters a cross-request in the EDP system of the Eurex 
Exchanges and thereby notifies the other Exchange Participants of the intended cross-trade or pre-
arranged trade. 
 
If the cross-order or pre-arranged order complies with or exceeds the minimum order size requirements 
established by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges for cross trades or pre-arranged 
trades, the Exchange Participant(s) is/are obligated to enter a cross-request in the EDP system of the 
Eurex Exchanges. 
 
If the initiating Exchange Participant notifies the cross-trade or pre-arranged trade by way of a cross-
request, including the intended quantity of contracts, it must have entered the orders or quotes giving 
rise to the cross-trade or pre-arranged trade 
 
- in the case of options contracts, no less than 15 seconds but no more than 75 seconds, 
 
- in the case of futures contracts, no less than 5 seconds but no more than 35 seconds, 
 
after the entry of the cross-request in the EDP system of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
If an Exchange Participant fails to comply with the foregoing procedures for the arrangement of a cross-
trade or pre-arranged trade, such failure shall be treated as an abuse; in addition, the crossing of orders 
and quotes of an Exchange Participant is not permitted to the extent that such Exchange Participant 
knowingly traded for its own account on the purchase side as well as on the sale side. 

1.3.6 Orders and Quotes with respect to Inter Product Spreads 
(1) Orders or quotes for Inter Product Spreads are orders to buy a specific number of contracts of a 
product and to sell simultaneously a specific number of contracts of another product. The Boards of 
Management of the Eurex Exchanges determine the product combinations tradable as Inter Product 
Spread as well as the number of contracts of each product the Inter Product Spread consists of. 
 
(2) Orders or quotes for an Inter Product Spread can only be executed against orders or quotes entered 
in the same Inter Product Spread. An execution of orders or quotes with respect to Inter Product Spreads 
against orders or quotes with respect to single products forming the basis of one Inter Product Spread is 
not possible. 
 
The following types of orders with respect to Inter Product Spreads are admissible: 
 
a) Market orders, 
 
b) Limit orders and 
 
c) Stop orders. 
 
(3) Orders or quotes for Inter Product Spreads may only be entered or changed during the Trading 
Period. The cancellation of orders is possible during the Pre-Trading Period and Post-Trading Full Period. 

1.4.5 Account Management 
(1) Positions in the Agent Position Accounts and in the Principal Position Accounts shall be gross 
positions, i.e., positions may be open on both the long and the short sides. Positions in M-position 
Accounts shall be net positions, i.e., each position may be either long or short. 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall monitor the position accounts of each Exchange Participant. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall make available to each Exchange Participant and to the Clearing Member that clears its 
accounts the balance and transaction details for all position accounts. 
 
(3) All open positions in option series shall automatically be cancelled in the position accounts of the 



Exchange Participants after the Post-Trading Period on the last trading day for the options contract 
concerned. All assigned short positions and all exercised long positions shall be cancelled in the position 
account of an Exchange Participant after the delivery or payment, as the case may be, in respect of such 
exercise or assignment, or the cash settlement in connection with such positions, has been made. 
 
(5) Adjustments to transactions (trade adjustments) may be entered during the Pre-Trading Period, the 
Pre-Opening Period, the Trading and Post-Trading Full Periods of any Exchange day. They are permitted 
with respect to transactions executed on the respective Exchange day and the preceding Exchange day. 
 
Closing position adjustments may be entered during the Pre-Trading Period, the Pre-Opening Period, the 
Trading Period and the Post-Trading Full Period of any Exchange day. Position transfers between position 
accounts of the same Exchange Participant may only be entered during the Pre-Trading Period and the 
Post-Trading Full Period of any Exchange day. 
 
(6) Position transfers between different Exchange Participants from or onto M-position accounts are not 
permitted. 
 
Position transfers between different Exchange Participants (member position transfer) may only be made 
by an Exchange Participant upon confirmation of the entry of the transfer as binding by all Exchange 
Participants and Clearing Members involved. Position transfers from or onto an Agent Position Account 
may only be made at the request of the customer concerned. The EDP system of the Eurex Exchanges 
will transfer the relevant positions after the Post-Trading Full Period. 
 
(7) Transfers of transactions from the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant to Agent 
Position Accounts and Principal Position Accounts of another Exchange Participant ("Give-Up Trades") 
may be made upon the instructions of the customer on the day of the respective trade and the following 
Exchange day, to the extent that: 
 
· an Exchange Participant ("Executing Broker") has executed a customer order, and 
 
· this order has been matched with another order or quote through the EDP system of the Eurex 
Exchanges in accordance with sub-sections 1.2.2 et seq., and 
 
· the matched transaction is an opening trade, and 
 
· the order or matched transaction was indicated as a Give Up Trade upon its input or matching, 
respectively, and 
 
· the transfer of the transaction was notified to the other Exchange Participant ("Clearing Broker"), and 
 
· this Exchange Participant (Clearing Broker) has confirmed its acceptance of the transaction, and 
 
· the Clearing Members concerned of both Exchange Participants have agreed to the transaction transfer, 
resulting in the transfer of the transaction to the Agent Position Account or Principal Position Account of 
the Clearing Broker. 

2.2.1.9 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period, with the exception of a day on which a dividend resolution is passed (American style option) 
provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not determined otherwise. If a 
dividend resolution is passed on a day that is not an Exchange day, the options in question may not be 
exercised on the Exchange day preceding such day. The last day on which an option may be exercised 
shall generally be the last trading day (subsection 2.2.1.5 paragraph (2)). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 



 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.1.10 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned to writers throughout the 
term of the option contract, including on the expiration day (subsection 2.2.1.5 paragraph (2) 
sentence 4). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by that Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.2.8 Exercise 
(1) The holder of an option purchased on the Eurex Exchanges may only exercise such option up to the 
end of the Post-Trading Full Period on the last trading day (subsection 2.2.2.5 paragraph (2)) thereof 
(European style). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. Subject to subsection 
2.2.2.8 paragraph (4), the Eurex Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) With respect to the principal accounts of Exchange Participants (M- and P-accounts), the Boards of 
Management of the Eurex Exchanges may order an automatic exercise in accordance with the criteria set 
by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(5) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on the exercise day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing to one of the 
Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(6) The exercise of an option entered during the course of the exercise day may be altered until the end 
of the Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.2.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period on the exercise day. Assignments shall be binding. 



 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.3.9 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period (American style) provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not 
determined otherwise. The last day on which an option may be exercised shall generally be the last 
trading day (subsection 2.2.3.5 paragraph (2)). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.3.10 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned to writers throughout the 
term of the option contract, including on the expiration day (subsection 2.2.3.5 paragraph (2) 
sentence 3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 

2.2.4.8 Exercise 
(1) The holder of an option purchased on the Eurex Exchanges may only exercise such option up to the 
end of the Post-Trading Full Period on the last trading day (subsection 2.2.4.5 paragraph (2)) thereof 
(European style). 



 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. Subject to subsection 
2.2.4.8 paragraph (4), the Eurex Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) With respect to the principal accounts of Exchange Participants (M- and P-accounts), the Boards of 
Management of the Eurex Exchanges may order an automatic exercise in accordance with the criteria set 
by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(5) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on the exercise day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing to one of the 
Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(6) The exercise of an option entered during the course of the exercise day may be altered until the end 
of the Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.4.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Period Full on the exercise day. Assignments shall be binding. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.6.8 Exercise 
(1) LEPO may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period (American style) provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not 
determined otherwise. The last day on which an option may be exercised shall generally be the last 
trading day (subsection 2.2.6.4 paragraph (2)). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 



2.2.6.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned to writers throughout the 
term of the option contract, including on the last trading day. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by that Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.7.8 Exercise 
(1) LEPOs may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period, with the exception of a day on which a dividend resolution is passed (American style option) 
provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not determined otherwise. If a 
dividend resolution is passed on a day that is not an Exchange day, the options in question may not be 
exercised on the Exchange day preceding such day. The last day on which an option may be exercised 
shall generally be the last trading day (subsection 2.2.7.4 paragraph (2)). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.7.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned throughout the term of an 
option contract, including on the last trading day. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 



(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.8.8 Exercise 
(1) The holder of an option purchased on the Eurex Exchanges may only exercise such option up to the 
end of the Post-Trading Full Period on the last trading day (subsection 2.2.8.5 paragraph (2)) thereof 
(European style). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. Subject to subsection 
2.2.8.8 paragraph (4), the Eurex Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) With respect to the principal accounts of Exchange Participants (M- and P-accounts), the Boards of 
Management of the Eurex Exchanges may order an automatic exercise in accordance with the criteria set 
by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(5) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on the exercise day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing to one of the 
Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(6) The exercise of an option entered during the course of the exercise day may be altered until the end 
of the Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.8.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period on the exercise day. Assignments shall be binding. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.9.8 Exercise 
(1) Options may generally be exercised by the purchaser only on the last trading day (subsection 2.2.9.5 
paragraph (2) sentences 1 and 2) of the contract (European style). 
 
The holder of an option purchased on the Eurex Exchanges may only exercise such option up to the end 
of the Post-Trading Full Period on the last trading day (subsection 2.2.9.5 paragraph (2)) thereof 
(European style). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 



(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. Subject to subsection 
2.2.9.8 paragraph (4), the Eurex Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) With respect to the principal accounts of Exchange Participants (M- and P-accounts), the Boards of 
Management of the Eurex Exchanges may order an automatic exercise in accordance with the criteria set 
by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(5) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on the exercise day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing to one of the 
Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(6) The exercise of an option entered during the course of the exercise day may be altered until the end 
of the Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.9.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period on the exercise day. Assignments shall be binding. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through Eurex Clearing AG by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.10.8 Exercise 
(1) Options may generally be exercised by the purchaser only on the last trading day (subsection 
2.2.10.5 paragraph (2) sentences 1 and 2) of the contract (European style). 
 
The holder of an option purchased on the Eurex Exchanges may only exercise such option up to the end 
of the Post-Trading Full Period on the last trading day (subsection 2.2.10.5 paragraph (2)) thereof 
(European style). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. Subject to subsection 
2.2.10.8 paragraph (4), the Eurex Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) With respect to the principal accounts of Exchange Participants (M- and P-accounts), the Boards of 
Management of the Eurex Exchanges may order an automatic exercise in accordance with the criteria set 
by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(5) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on the exercise day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing to one of the 
Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 



(6) The exercise of an option entered during the course of the exercise day may be altered until the end 
of the Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.10.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period on the exercise day. Assignments shall be binding. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through Eurex Clearing AG by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.11.8 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day during the term until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period (American style). The last exercise day shall generally be the last trading day 
(subsection 2.2.11.5 paragraph (2) sentences 1 and 2). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex Exchanges 
shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of the option contract. Any such request transmitted in writing to 
one of the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request 
shall be entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during any day may be altered until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.11.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned throughout the term of an 
option contract, including on its expiration day (subsection 2.2.11.5 paragraph (2) sentence 3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through Eurex Clearing AG by a random selection process con-ducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 



(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.12.8 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day during the term until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period (American style). The last exercise day shall generally be the last trading day 
(subsection 2.2.12.5 paragraph (2) sentences 1 and 2). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex Exchanges 
shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing 
to one of the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request 
shall be entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during any day may be altered until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period of the date of entry. 

2.2.12.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned throughout the term of an 
options contract, including on its expiration day (subsection 2.2.12.5 paragraph (2) sentence 3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through Eurex Clearing AG by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.13.8 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day during the term until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period (American style). The last exercise day shall generally be the last trading day 
(subsection 2.2.13.5 paragraph (2) sentences 1 and 2). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex Exchanges 
shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing 



to one of the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request 
shall be entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during any day may be altered until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.13.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned throughout the term of an 
options contract, including on its expiration day (subsection 2.2.13.5 paragraph (2) sentence 3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through Eurex Clearing AG by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.14.8 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day during the term until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period (American style). The last exercise day shall generally be the last trading day 
(subsection 2.2.14.5 paragraph (2) sentence 1, 2 and 3). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last 10 Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. Subject to subsection 
2.2.14.8, paragraph 4, the Eurex Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) With respect to the principal accounts of Exchange Participants (P- and M-accounts), the Boards of 
Management of the Eurex Exchanges may order an automatic exercise in accordance with the criteria set 
by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(5) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing 
to one of the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request 
shall be entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(6) The exercise of an option entered during any day may be altered until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.14.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned throughout the term of an 
options contract, including on its expiration day (subsection 2.2.14.5 paragraph (2) sentence 3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 



(3) Assignments shall be made through Eurex Clearing AG by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.15.9 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period (American style option) provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges 
have not determined otherwise. The last day on which an option may be exercised shall generally be the 
last trading day. 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.15.10 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned throughout the term of an 
option contract, including on its expiration day (subsection 2.2.15.5 paragraph (2) sentence 3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.16.8 Exercise 
(1) LEPOs may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period (American style) provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not 
determined otherwise. The last day on which an option may be exercised shall generally be the last 
trading day (subsection 2.2.16.4 paragraph (2)). 



 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.16.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned throughout the term of an 
option contract, including on the expiration day (subsection 2.2.16.4 paragraph (2) sentence 3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.17.8 Exercise 
(1) The purchaser of an option may generally only exercise such option up to the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period on the last trading day (subsection 2.2.17.5 paragraph (2)) thereof (European style). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant is responsible for exercising its options contracts. Subject to subsection 
2.2.17.8 paragraph (4), the Eurex Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) With respect to the principal accounts of Exchange Participants (M- and P-accounts), the Boards of 
Management of the Eurex Exchanges may order an automatic exercise in accordance with the criteria set 
by the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges. 
 
(5) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on the exercise day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted in writing to one of the 
Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(6) The exercise of an option entered during the course of the exercise day may be altered until the end 
of the Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 



2.2.17.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period on the exercise day. Assignments shall be binding. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by such Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.19.9 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercises by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period (American style) provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not 
determined otherwise. The last day on which an option may be exercises shall generally be the last 
trading day (subsection 2.2.19.5 paragraph (2)). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.19.10 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned to writers throughout the 
term of the option contract, including on the expiration day (subsection 2.2.19.5 paragraph (2) sentence 
3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-Positions Accounts of an Exchange 



Participant must be performed by that Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to 
customers. 

2.2.20.8 Exercise 
(1) LEPO may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period (American style) provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not 
determined otherwise. The last day on which an option may be exercised shall generally be the last 
trading day (subsection 2.2.20.4 paragraph (2)). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extend possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.20.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned to writers throughout the 
term of the option contract, including on the last trading day. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by that Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

2.2.21.9 Exercise 
(1) Options may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading 
Full Period (American style) provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not 
determined otherwise. The last day on which an option may be exercised shall generally be the last 
trading day (subsection 2.2.21.5 paragraph (2)). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series of options contracts then becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising the options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 



Period on or before the last trading day of an options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extent possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.21.10 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned to writers throughout the 
term of the option contract, including on the expiration day (subsection 2.2.21.5 paragraph (2) sentence 
3). 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after its announcement. 
 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-Positions Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by that Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to 
customers. 

2.2.22.8 Exercise 
(1) LEPO may be exercised by the purchaser on any Exchange day until the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period (American style) provided that the Boards of Management of the Eurex Exchanges have not 
determined otherwise. The last day on which an option may be exercised shall generally be the last 
trading day (subsection 2.2.22.4 paragraph (2)). 
 
(2) The Eurex Exchanges shall inform the Exchange Participants on each of the last ten Exchange days 
before the last trading day of an option series on options contracts becoming due. 
 
(3) Each Exchange Participant shall be responsible for exercising its options contracts. The Eurex 
Exchanges shall not automatically exercise any options contracts. 
 
(4) In the event of an EDP failure, the Eurex Exchanges must receive a written exercise request from the 
Exchange Participant concerned (e.g., by letter or fax) no later than the end of the Post-Trading Full 
Period on or before the last trading day of the options contract. Any such request transmitted to one of 
the Eurex Exchanges shall be deemed submitted to all Eurex Exchanges. The exercise request shall be 
entered by the Eurex Exchanges to the extend possible using reasonable efforts. 
 
(5) The exercise of an option entered during the course of any day may be altered until the end of the 
Post-Trading Full Period on the date of entry. 

2.2.22.9 Assignment 
(1) All exercises shall be assigned to the writers of the exercised option series after the end of the Post-
Trading Full Period. Assignments shall be binding. Exercises may be assigned to writers throughout the 
term of the option contract, including on the last trading day. 
 
(2) The Exchange Participants and Clearing Members affected by any such assignment shall be notified 
thereof during the morning of the following Exchange day. 
 
(3) Assignments shall be made through the Eurex Exchanges by a random selection process conducted in 
accordance with detailed rules. The assignment method shall be communicated to the Exchange 
Participants. Any change of such method shall become effective only after notice thereof. 



 
(4) All assignments made for the Agent Position Account of an Exchange Participant shall be assigned by 
such Exchange Participant to the positions of its customers, on the basis of a procedure that ensures the 
neutrality of the assignment process. 
 
(5) All assignments made for the Principal Position Accounts or M-position Accounts of an Exchange 
Participant must be performed by that Exchange Participant and may not be transferred onward to its 
customers. 

 


